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Unit Price Unit Total Unit Price Unit Total Unit Price Unit Total Unit Price Unit Total

1 Thermoplastic Pavement 
Markings - Line 4" LF 9,436 0.53$                5,001.08$          0.85$            8,020.60$           0.60$         5,661.60$           0.90$                  8,492.40$           

2 Thermoplastic Pavement 
Markings - Line 6" LF 3,146 0.80$                2,516.80$          1.35$            4,247.10$           0.75$         2,359.50$           1.35$                  4,247.10$           

3 Thermoplastic Pavement 
Markings - Line 12" LF 415 2.00$                830.00$             3.50$            1,452.50$           1.65$         684.75$              2.70$                  1,120.50$           

4 Thermoplastic Pavement 
Markings - Line 24" LF 36 4.00$                144.00$             7.00$            252.00$              5.00$         180.00$              5.50$                  198.00$              

5 Thermoplastic Pavement 
Markings-Letters & Sym. SF * 315 4.75$                1,496.25$          5.00$            1,575.00$           4.00$         1,260.00$           5.50$                  1,732.50$           

*  Quantity raised from 18 sf to 315 sf

Bid Alternate

Unit Price Unit Total Unit Price Unit Total Unit Price Unit Total Unit Price Unit Total

1
Wet Reflective Preformed 
Plastic Pavement  marking - 
Line 12"

LF 864 5.85$                5,054.40$          8.00$            6,912.00$           no bid no bid

2
Bituminous Surface removal 
for Recessed Pavement 
Marking, 0.1 Inch Depth

SF 864 3.75$                3,240.00$          4.00$            3,456.00$           no bid no bid

Unit Price Unit Total Unit Price Unit Total Unit Price Unit Total Unit Price Unit Total
TOTAL BID + BID ALTERNATE  $        18,282.53  $        25,915.20 -- --

Unit Approx. 
Quant.

 $                                15,547.20 

Marking Specialists

14,062.20$                                 
 Bid Totals

As Read

As Calculated

AC Pavement Striping

 $                                      9,988.13 

8,577.38$                                       

Item # Superior Road Striping Mark It Corp.

8,957.85$                                

 $                             10,145.85 

14,157.00$                                       

 $                                       15,790.50 

Item

Item # Item Unit Approx. 
Quant.

AC Pavement Striping Marking Specialists

 Bid Totals As Read 8,294.40$                                       10,368.00$                                 
As Calculated  $                                      8,294.40 

Superior Road Striping Mark It Corp.

 $                                10,368.00  $                                          -    $                                                    -   

Superior Road Striping Mark It Corp.

Item Unit Approx. 
Quant.

AC Pavement Striping Marking Specialists
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